
        NCR WATCH DESK 
SUNRISE BRIEF, JUNE 6, 2020 

 

 UNCLASSIFIED 

I. WEATHER 
 
• Today: Patchy fog before 10AM. 20% chance 

of isolated showers and thunderstorms after 
2PM. Otherwise, partly sunny and mostly clear. 
High 93°. Low 64°.  

 

 
 
• National Capital Region: NWS issued a 

Hazardous Weather Outlook for most of the 
NCR. A few thunderstorms could produce 
isolated instances of damaging wind gusts 
near and east of Interstate 95 this afternoon. 

 
II. DEVELOPMENTS OF NOTE 

 
• District of Columbia: Police are seeking the 

public’s assistance in locating 66-year-old 
Bonnita Spikes, who was last seen in the 2000 
block of Georgia Ave NW on Friday, June 5. 
Anyone with information is asked to call (202) 
727-9099 or text 50411. 

 

 
Photo of Bonnita Pikes (Source: MPD) 

• City of Alexandria: All eastbound lanes of I-66 
were closed for several hours last night due to 
a fatal pedestrian collision. Lanes reopened at 
5:50AM. 

 
• City of Alexandria: Alexandria Police (APD) 

began working a barricade situation in an 
apartment building in the 2900 block of Main 
Line Blvd at around 11AM yesterday. Some 
residents were evacuated from the building. 
Fairfax County Police relieved APD to continue 
with the barricade overnight. The situation was 
resolved before 6AM this morning with the 
subject in custody without further incident. 

 
III. COVID-19 (CORONAVIRUS) 
 
• National Capital Region: There are 68,287 

COVID-19 cases and 2,621 fatalities reported 
in the NCR. DC, MD, VA 
 

• District of Columbia: Beginning Monday, 
June 8, residents will be able to participate in 
curbside pickup and remote printing at select 
libraries. Firehouses across the city are 
offering residents free walk-up COVID-19 
testing from 4PM to 8PM. 

 
• District of Columbia: A DC School Family 

Engagement Survey was launched to collect 
feedback to better understand family 
preferences for how students will engage in 
learning during the 2020-2021 school year. 
The survey is available until June 8 at 10PM.   
  

• City of Alexandria: An interactive dashboard 
was developed to locate food distribution 
events and measure the impact of the 
combined efforts of public and private 
organizations to food distribution since the 
beginning of COVID-19. 

 
• Montgomery County: Applications for the 

Microenterprise Stabilization Program (MSP) 
will be accepted beginning at 10AM 
Wednesday, June 10 through Tuesday, June 
16. The MSP initiative is designed to help for-
profit businesses with five or fewer employees. 

https://forecast.weather.gov/showsigwx.php?warnzone=WVZ053&warncounty=WVC037&firewxzone=WVZ053&local_place1=Charles%20Town%20WV&product1=Hazardous+Weather+Outlook&lat=39.2851&lon=-77.8575#.XttuAzpKiUk
https://twitter.com/DCPoliceDept/status/1269055107079045120/photo/1
https://twitter.com/ArlingtonAlert/status/1269129754306916352
https://twitter.com/AlexandriaVAPD/status/1269207968077287429
https://coronavirus.dc.gov/page/coronavirus-data
https://coronavirus.maryland.gov/
http://www.vdh.virginia.gov/surveillance-and-investigation/novel-coronavirus/
https://coronavirus.dc.gov/sites/default/files/dc/sites/dhcd/publication/attachments/Situational%20Update%20Presentation_060520.pdf
https://coronavirus.dc.gov/sites/default/files/dc/sites/dhcd/publication/attachments/Situational%20Update%20Presentation_060520.pdf
https://coronavirus.dc.gov/sites/default/files/dc/sites/dhcd/publication/attachments/Situational%20Update%20Presentation_060520.pdf
https://coronavirus.dc.gov/page/our-schools-0
https://coronavirus.dc.gov/page/our-schools-0
https://geoportal.alexandriava.gov/portal/apps/opsdashboard/index.html#/b72807fdb1324c8c948e445ba55011c8
https://www.montgomerycountymd.gov/biz-resources/msp/



