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 UNCLASSIFIED 

I. WEATHER 
 
• Today: Areas of fog before 10AM. Patchy 

drizzle before 12PM, then 20% chance of 
showers. High 78°. Low 67°.  
 

 
 
II. DEVELOPMENTS OF NOTE 
 
National Capital Region  

 
• Prince George’s County: Fire and EMS 

responded to the 6000 blk of 34th Ave in 
Hyattsville for a two-story house fire. One adult 
occupant had self-evacuated. One firefighter 
was transported to the hospital for evaluation. 
 

 
Firefighters responded to a two-story house fire in Hyattsville 
with one firefighter transported to the hospital for evaluation 

(Source: PGFD) 
 

• Montgomery County: County Detectives are 
asking for the public’s assistance in locating a 
missing 25-year-old Rockville man due to 
concern for his physical and emotional welfare.  

 
III. COVID-19 (CORONAVIRUS) 
 
• Overview: Johns Hopkins University reports 

5,606,925 COVID-19 cases, 350,862 deaths, 
and 2,301,727 recoveries worldwide as of 
6AM. In the US, there are 1,681,418 cases, 
98,929 deaths, and 384,902 recoveries. 

 
• National Capital Region: There are 57,809 

COVID-19 cases and 2,286 fatalities reported 
in the NCR. DC, MD, VA 

 
• Virginia: The Governor amended Executive 

Order Fifty-One, extending the state’s 
emergency declaration. 

 
• City of Alexandria: On May 28 at 5PM, the 

city, in partnership with World Central Kitchen, 
will distribute meals and groceries at Ramsay 
Elementary School. 

 
• Fairfax County: As of May 25, Fire and 

Rescue (FCFRD) reports seven personnel 
have tested positive for COVID-19. Fourteen 
have recovered while six remain in quarantine. 
FCFRD continues to fully staff all stations and 
apparatus. 

 
• Prince William County: On June 12 at 

4:30PM, Public Schools will open registration 
for its elementary and middle school programs. 
Due to COVID-19, there will be no late or on-
site registration. The Summer School Office 
will provide all programs to families by June 24. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://twitter.com/PGFDNews/status/1265551918723739651
http://www.mymcpnews.com/2020/05/27/concern-for-missing-man-from-rockville/
https://www.arcgis.com/apps/opsdashboard/index.html#/bda7594740fd40299423467b48e9ecf6
https://coronavirus.dc.gov/page/coronavirus-data
https://coronavirus.maryland.gov/
http://www.vdh.virginia.gov/surveillance-and-investigation/novel-coronavirus/
https://www.governor.virginia.gov/media/governorvirginiagov/executive-actions/EO-61-and-Order-Of-Public-Health-Emergency-Three-AMENDED---Phase-One-Easing-Of-Certain-Temporary-Restrictions-Due-To-Novel-Coronavirus-(COVID-19).pdf
https://www.governor.virginia.gov/media/governorvirginiagov/executive-actions/EO-61-and-Order-Of-Public-Health-Emergency-Three-AMENDED---Phase-One-Easing-Of-Certain-Temporary-Restrictions-Due-To-Novel-Coronavirus-(COVID-19).pdf
https://www.alexandriava.gov/uploadedFiles/dchs/economicsupport/COVID_WebBox/WCKWestEndEnglish5.28.pdf
https://www.alexandriava.gov/uploadedFiles/dchs/economicsupport/COVID_WebBox/WCKWestEndEnglish5.28.pdf
https://ffxfirerescue.wordpress.com/2020/05/26/may-26-covid-19-update-for-fairfax-county-fire-and-rescue-personnel/
https://ffxfirerescue.wordpress.com/2020/05/26/may-26-covid-19-update-for-fairfax-county-fire-and-rescue-personnel/
http://www.pwcs.edu/news/what_s_new/2020_summer_program_dates



