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UNCLASSIFIED 

I. WEATHER 
 

• Today: 30% chance of showers after 4PM. 
Mostly cloudy. High 49°. Low 35°. 
 

 
II. DEVELOPMENTS OF NOTE 
 

National Capital Region  
 

• District of Columbia: The US Speaker of the 
House, Nancy Pelosi, will conduct a tree 
lighting ceremony on the west lawn of the US 
Capitol today. The Capitol Christmas tree will 
feature thousands of handcrafted ornaments 
and will be lit each night at dusk until 11PM 
through January. Link 
 

• Prince George’s County: A man has died 
after being struck by a Metro train he 
reportedly placed himself in the path of in 
Capitol Heights. The Silver Line and Blue Line 
trains single-tracked following the incident. The 
incident is under investigation. Link  

 
United States 
 

• Wisconsin: Within 24 hours, six schools have 
had threats reported. Two teenagers – 91 
miles apart – were shot by police officers inside 
their high schools. The latest school shooting 
happened Tuesday morning in Oshkosh, when 
a student brought a gun to school became 
involved in a confrontation with a resource 
officer and the officer shot the student. Both 
were injured during the incident and were 
transported to local hospitals. Link 

World 
 

• Sudan: An explosion occurred at a ceramic’s 
factory triggered by a fire has killed 23 people 
and injured more than 130 others in northern 
Khartoum. The factory’s blast blew an outside 
tanker into a nearby lot. The fire destroyed the 
factory. An initial observation indicated a lack 
of safety measures in addition to random 
storage of flammable materials. Link 
 

 
Members of the Sudanese Civil Defense put out the fire at a 

factory unit (Source: CNN) 

 

• Afghanistan: Six people were killed when  
gunmen opened fire on a vehicle belonging to 
a Japanese physician and aid workers in 
Nangarhar province. This is the second attack 
in weeks targeting aid workers. No one has 
claimed responsibility for the attack. In 
November, a grenade hit a vehicle that injured 
two and killed six, one of which was an 
American working for the United Nations. Link 
 

• Global: The FBI, US Attorney’s Office, and the 
State Department have continued their 
extensive investigation since 2010 to locate 
Jehad Serwan Mostafa, a US citizen believed 
to be leading al-Shabaab’s explosives 
department and has been involved in the use 
of improvised explosive devices. Mostafa 
remains on the FBI’s Most Wanted Terrorist 
List and is believed to be in Somalia currently. 
Link 
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